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Date 11/29/19 Page 1
Account No. 6073204
Enclosures 3

Rancho Santiago Community College Distri
Depository Clearing Account
2323 N Broadway Ste 404-2
Santa Ana CA 92706-1640

Account Title: Rancho Santiago Community College Distri
Depository Clearing Account

Get the convenience & security of F&M
with Digital Wallet, FMB-Mobile 2.0, and F&M Alerts.

See insert for details.

Business Checking Number of Enclosures 3
Account Number 6073204 Statement Dates 11/01/19 thru 12/01/19
Beginning Balance 345,000.00 Days in the statement period 31

99 Deposits/Credits 4,091,591.46 Average Ledger 345,000.00
25 Checks/Debits 4,091,591.46

Service Charge .00
Interest Paid .00
Ending Balance 345,000.00

Deposits and Other Credits
Date Description Amount
11/01 Deposit 1000 5,959.35
11/01 36 TREAS 310 MISC PAY 101036150280668 9101036151 CT 345.00

ISA*00*0000000000*00*000000000
0*ZZ*US TREASURY 310*ZZ*VENDOR
PAYMENTS*191031*0541*U*00200*
044174393*0*P*~\
ST*820*087270227\
BPR*C*345*C*ACH*CTX*01*1010361
51*ZZ*36001200***01*122201198*
DA*6073204*191101**ZZ*NOT\
REF*72*201030321\
REF*55*00000150\
N1*PE*RANCHO SANTIAGO COMM COL
G DIST*FI*952696799\
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Date 11/29/19 Page 2
Account No. 6073204
Enclosures 3

Business Checking 6073204 (Continued)

Deposits and Other Credits
Date Description Amount

N1*PR*VAFA TREAS 310*92*360012
00\
ENT*1\
N1*15*LOS ANGELES CA
VARO\

N3*11000 WILSHIRE BLVD\
N4*****BS*LOS ANGELES, CA 900
24\
PER*IC*VENDR-INQUIRY*TE*( 310
) 235 - 7539\
RMR*IV*VOCR-082719-1**345\
REF*DD*WV34493030096*LOS ANGEL
ES CA VARO\
DTM*003*190827\
SE*15*087270227\
IEA*1*044174393\

11/01 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000013140903 WFBEHPS001 C 723.60
11/01 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000013071806 WFBEHPS001 C 15,827.90
11/04 vDeposit 122,236.25
11/04 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000011857395 WFBEHPS001 C 372.00
11/04 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000012623898 WFBEHPS001 C 756.36
11/04 TMobileUSA PMD PAYMENT 051000018455547 7010532275 CCD 3,636.14
11/04 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000017018103 WFBEHPS001 C 7,057.90
11/04 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000011792731 WFBEHPS001 C 17,851.60
11/05 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000013714694 WFBEHPS001 C 7,148.70
11/06 Deposit 1000 1,080.00
11/06 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000017704453 WFBEHPS001 C 1,321.60
11/06 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000017730528 WFBEHPS001 C 5,820.45
11/07 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000017809272 WFBEHPS001 C 1,294.86
11/07 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000017710323 WFBEHPS001 C 8,312.80
11/07 Transfer from DDA Acct No. 6073026-D 550,768.28
11/08 Deposit 5000 16.00
11/08 Deposit 5000 16.00
11/08 Deposit 5000 4,206.75
11/08 Deposit 5000 11,618.20
11/08 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000011370409 WFBEHPS001 C 1,546.25
11/08 CREDENTIALS SOLU PARKING 051000013396606 1352612568 CCD 5,399.54

NTE*Parking Revenue\
11/08 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000011405519 WFBEHPS001 C 23,107.45
11/12 Deposit 1000 999.75
11/12 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000014708045 WFBEHPS001 C 671.30
11/12 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000015618658 WFBEHPS001 C 940.75
11/12 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000011674802 WFBEHPS001 C 5,091.95
11/12 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000010033618 WFBEHPS001 C 5,840.45
11/12 HRTLAND PMT SYS TXNS/FEES 091000015697599 WFBEHPS001 C 8,461.55
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From:  Deborah Nobles <Nobles@ascip.org>

Sent time:  10/15/2019 05:47:09 PM

To:  Maus, Donald

Subject:  RE: Risk Management Deposit Fund
 

Hi Don.

Thank you for the email.  Our accounting department has reviewed the submitted documentation and 
will process.  Upon receipt of the check, will forward to your attention.  

Should there be any questions, please feel free to contact me.  Have a wonderful evening.

Best Regards,

Deborah         
Deborah Nobles, CSRM
Senior Risk Services Consultant

Alliance of Schools for Cooperative Insurance Programs
16550 Bloomfield Avenue, Cerritos, CA  90703
(562((40448029 Office
(562) 404-8038 Fax
nobles@ascip.org

-----Original Message-----
From: Maus, Donald  
Sent: Tuesday, October 15, 2019 11:42 AM
To: Deborah Nobles 
Subject: Risk Management Deposit Fund

Hi Deborah,

We would like to request a withdrawal from our Risk Management Deposit Fund in the amount of 
$13,000.  See attached paperwork.

Let me know if you need anything else.

Thanks.

Don
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From:  Marycella Healy <Healy@ascip.org>

Sent time:  10/16/2019 05:35:36 PM

To:  Maus, Donald

Cc:  Deborah Nobles <Nobles@ascip.org>

Subject:  RE: Risk Management Deposit Fund Withdrawal - Rancho Santiago CCD
 

Check#25557862  for $13,000 will be mailed today to the  following address:

Rancho Santiago CCD
2323 North Broadway 
Santa Ana, CA 92706
Attn: Don Maus-Risk Management 

Marycella Healy

Alliance of Schools for Cooperative Insurance Programs
16550 Bloomfield Avenue, Cerritos, CA  90703
(562((40448029
Email: Healy@ascip.org

-----Original Message-----
From: Maus, Donald  
Sent: Tuesday, October 15, 2019 11:42 AM
To: Deborah Nobles 
Subject: Risk Management Deposit Fund

Hi Deborah,

We would like to request a withdrawal from our Risk Management Deposit Fund in the amount of 
$13,000.  See attached paperwork.

Let me know if you need anything else.

Thanks.

Don




